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Team Essay – Firewagon Hockey 

You did not want to get into a run-and-gun game with the Rangers. They were 12-1-0 in 
games in which more than eight goals were scored, and 9-2-0 in games where exactly eight 
goals were scored. That’s 20-3-0 in the highest scoring games they played.  

In those 23 high-scoring games the Rangers outscored their opponents 126-75. In the 59 
lower scoring games the Rangers outscored their opponents 151-144. The following chart 
shows that when the Rangers got into a higher-scoring game, it was because they were doing 
the extra scoring: their opponent’s average score in higher-scoring games was almost the 
same as it was in the lower-scoring games. 
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I noticed that their opponents in high-scoring games were more playoff teams than non-
playoff teams, by twelve to eleven. Given they played playoff teams 39 times and non-playoff 
teams 43 times, a 12-11 split in 23 games is close to meaningless. That it is meaningless 
doesn’t mean it isn’t fun to point out, and it does sound like it should be meaningful. I may 
yet become a sportswriter. 

In their high-scoring games the Rangers scored extremely well: by that I mean they scored 
much higher than expected. Their expected goals total for those games was 79.74 and their 
actual goals scored was 126, which is 46 more goals than expected over those 23 games.  

The benefits the Rangers got from scoring can also be seen in the results of the games in 
which they didn’t score. They were 6-5-1 when scoring exactly three goals, and 6-17-12 in 
games in which they scored fewer than three goals (for a total of 12-22-13). It isn’t 
particularly earth-shattering that teams have worse records when they score fewer goals, but 
again, it sounds impressive. I’m moving a little closer to being a sportswriter: I may have to 
buy a fedora and a manual typewriter. 

Why did the Rangers get hot as shooters in those 23 games? If I knew the answer to that 
question, I’d guard the answer quite jealously and sell it only to the Ottawa Senators. If the 
Rangers knew the answer to that question, they would have had far more shootout games. 

 


