
2022-23 Season Review – Toronto Maple Leafs 
 

  
Stapled To The Bench Page 1 of 6 V1 

 
 

Standings 

  

Team Record by Game Type 

 

Talent Distribution 

 

  



2022-23 Season Review – Toronto Maple Leafs 
 

  
Stapled To The Bench Page 2 of 6 V1 

 
 

Return From Play 

 

 

Lines and Pairs 

  

 

  



2022-23 Season Review – Toronto Maple Leafs 
 

  
Stapled To The Bench Page 3 of 6 V1 

 
 

Team Leaders – Stapled To The Bench Categories 
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Team Essay #1 – Chart Options 

I come neither to praise the Leafs nor to bury them. I live in Ottawa and am a fan of the 
Senators: it isn’t necessary to dislike the Leafs, but it happens naturally. To avoid both 
bashing and praising the Leafs, I’ll do an article about how best to show an oddity in 
Toronto’s regular season play. Let’s start with worst way: just numbers.  
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Now I have to admit that I’m a numbers guy, so the oddity just jumped out at me from this 
table (it’s also visible on the Team Results Table). When comparing teams it is generally 
good to compare teams that are similar: the other teams in the table all were within four 
points of Toronto at the end of the season. 

I will reveal the oddity after the next examples. The two charts are the same chart showing 
the same data, with the only difference between them being the horizontal scale. 

 

The oddity for Toronto is that they had a better record against playoff-bound teams than 
against teams that didn’t make the playoffs.  

It is usually a good idea to ensure charts go down to 0.000, as does Chart #1. In this specific 
instance, it is a good idea to zoom in on the actual data range, as in Chart #2. This could be 
considered a statistical trick, as it emphasizes the difference between the blue and orange 
lines. That’s okay with this oddity because it is the difference which is interesting. 

I think a bar chart best displays the oddity.  

 

The hardest part about this chart is coming up with a title: I couldn’t think of a title that fit 
inside the chart. “Points Percentage Difference Between Non-Playoff Opponents and Playoff 
Opponents” is less a title and more a paragraph, but it does explain what is being shown.  
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Also missing is an explanation of the horizontal scale. Bars going to the right show that a 
team had a better record against non-playoff teams: for example, Carolina’s points-
percentage against non-playoff teams was 0.198 higher than their points-percentage against 
playoff teams. The stub going to the left shows that Toronto had a slightly better record 
against playoff teams. The different lengths of bars show just how odd Toronto’s record 
against non-playoff teams was, compared to teams that had about the same record. 

You’ll also notice that I used abbreviations in place of team names. Full team names just 
made the chart messier to read. 

Is focusing on Toronto’s record against non-playoff teams a slight to the Leafs? I don’t think 
so, but we could also chart Toronto’s record against the playoff-bound teams. 

 

It goes to figure. If Toronto had an unusually poor record against non-playoff teams 
compared to the teams close to them in the standings, they had to have been better against 
playoff-bound teams.  

Which chart you’d use depends on what you want to focus on. 

Toronto’s relatively poor play against the lesser lights of the league did not hurt them in the 
standings. Given their record against playoff-bound teams, they should have gone 33-6-4 
against non-playoff teams. That would have given them 123 points instead of the 111 points 
they actually had. They would have been in exactly the same playoff slot, and would have 
faced exactly the same first-round opponent.  

Team Essay #2 – Respect Given, Grudgingly 

Auston Matthews was the sixth best center in the league, and he was the most disruptive 
forward in the league (DX – Disruption Index). If you watch a Leaf game and pay attention 
to what Matthews does when the opposition has the puck, you are bound to be impressed.  

John Tavares had the fourth highest powerplay rating in the league (PX – Powerplay Index). 
No, really, he was fourth in the league. He was the highest rated powerplay specialist that 
did not play for the Edmonton Oilers.  
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Mitchell Marner was the 13th most productive player in the league (Productivity Rating), and 
Auston Matthews was the 3rd most valuable player in the league (Value Rating).  

Mark Giordano was the oldest player in the league, and Toronto got more than their money’s 
worth from him.  


